
Saturday  3 November 2018

12:04 All Night Programme

Including: 12:05 Music after Midnight (RNZ);
12:30 Laugh Track (RNZ); 1:05 From The Wold
(BBC); 1:45 Short Story Club (RNZ); 2:05 NZ
Live New Valley Stompers(RNZ); 3:05 Passport
to Hell by Robin Hyde read by Catherine
Wilkin (4 of 15, RNZ); 3:30 The Week (RNZ);
4:30 Global Business (BBC); 5:10 Witness
(BBC); 5:45 Voices (RNZ)

6:08 Storytime

The New Boy, by Elsie Locke, told by Dorothy
McKegg; Crusty Meat Pie, by Joy Cowley, told
by Liz Mullane; Hone the Stone Boy, by Karen
Sidney, told by Hinewehi Mohi; Cady
Cockroach and the Crumby Kitchen, by Anne
Tucker, told by Lorae Parry; Gertrude
Finklebottom and the Deadly Duo, by
Michelanne Forster, told by Alice Fraser (RNZ)

7:10 Country Life

Memorable scenes, people and places in
rural New Zealand (RNZ)

8:10 Saturday Morning with Kim Hill

A mixture of current affairs and feature
interviews, until midday (RNZ)

12:11 The Podcast Hour

In The Podcast Hour Richard Scott hunts out
the best podcasts from New Zealand and
around the world to help you discover what
to listen to next (RNZ)

1:10 Music 101

The best songs, music-related stories,
interviews, live music, industry news and
music documentaries from NZ and the world

5:10 Focus on Politics

Analysis of significant political issues
presented by Radio New Zealand's
parliamentary reporting team (RNZ)

5:30 Tagata o te Moana

Pacific news, features, interviews and music
for all New Zealanders, giving an insight into
the diverse cultures of the Pacific people
(RNZI)

6:06 WOMAD Taranaki 2018

Rahim Al Haj trio (RNZ)

7:06 Saturday Night with Phil O'Brien

An evening of requests, nostalgia and musical
memories (RNZ)

Sunday  4 November 2018

12:04 All Night Programme

12:05 Music after Midnight; 12:30 After The
Crash (BBC); 1:05 Our Changing World (RNZ);
2:05 Heart and Soul (BBC); 2:35 Hymns on
Sunday (RNZ); 3:05 Passport to Hell by Robin
Hyde read by Catherine Wilkin (5 of 15, RNZ);
3:30 CrowdScience (BBC); 4:30 TTe Waonui a
Te Manu Korihi  (RNZ) 5:10 Michael King's
History of New Zealand (1 of 30, RNZ); 5:45
Historical Highlight: Le Quesnoy (RNZ)

6:08 Storytime

The Hunt, by Winifred Owen, told by Mark
Hadlow; To The Dump!, by Sharon Whillis,
told by Kelson Henderson; Remember that
November, by Jennifer Beck, told by Maaka
Pohatu and Ngahuia Piripi; Guido's Guy
Fawkes Night, by Pat Quinn, told by Diana
Burns; Miere the Bee, by Apirana Taylor, told
by Apirana Taylor; Evil Fred, by Kylie Begg,
told by Gerald Bryan (RNZ)

7:10 Sunday Morning with Wallace
Chapman

A fresh attitude on current affairs, the news
behind the news, in-depth documentaries,
sport from the outfield, politics from the
insiders, plus Mediawatch, 'The House' and
music
7:35 The House
Legislation, issues and insights from
Parliament (RNZ)
8:10 Insight
An award-winning documentary programme
providing comprehensive coverage of
national and international current affairs
(RNZ)
9:06 Mediawatch
Critical examination and analysis of recent
performance and trends in New Zealand's
news media (RNZ)

12:12 Two Cents Worth

 A weekly podcast on the news that will affect
your back pocket - with Bernard Hickey, Nikki
Mandow, Jenee Tibshraeny and Gyles
Beckford    In The First Episode we delve into
the environmentally unfriendly obsession
New Zealanders seem to have with double-
cab utes. (RNZ)

12:30 Standing Room Only with Lynn
Freeman

It's an 'all access pass' to what's happening in

the worlds of arts and entertainment
1:10 At the Movies
A weekly topical magazine programme about
current film releases and film-related topics
(RNZ)
2:05 The Laugh Track

3:04 Beyond Kate

125 years since NZ became the first country
to give women the vote, who were the
women who signed the petition and changed
the world and what's their legacy today? (7)
Education - An exploration of what it meant
for young women to 'get an education' in
New Zealand (in the late 19th Century)
included sitting in class writing down scone
recipes by hand, preparing for a life as
homemaker. But there were some women
who broke the mold, determined to make
headway at a time when the institutions said
no. Also a look at the kinds of schools
available in NZ in the past, rights for women
to study at university, and the way our
education system even today, teaches kids
more about gendered roles than you might
think (7 of 8, RNZ)

4:06 The Sunday Feature

AC Grayling Can modern democracy be
saved? 

In his  book Democracy and Its Crisis, Prof AC
Grayling of the New College of the
Humanities in London investigates why
institutions of democracy across the globe
are struggling to hold up against the forces
they were designed to keep in check. He
discusses our contemporary political
situation and its historical roots with MP
Chris Finlayson in this session recorded at the
2018 NZ Festival Writers and Readers
programme.

5:00 The World at Five

A roundup of today's news and sport

5:10 Heart and Soul

Hashtag Pray  More  than half of the British
population now say they have no religion. Yet
in the Twitter-sphere, faith seems alive and
well; hashtags like #PrayforLondon invariably
start trending after a terror attack. And when
someone dies, they are often addressed on
social media as though they were still able to
read those messages like “Fly with the angels
in the star,s.  Are people who have turned
their backs on organised religion making up
their own comforting set of beliefs when it
comes to the most difficult things in life, such
as death and the loss of loved ones?  (BBC)

5:40 Te Waonui a Te Manu Korihi

A weekly roundup of news on Maori issues
(RNZ)

6:06 Te Ahi Kaa

Exploring issues and events from a tangata
whenua perspective (RNZ)

6:40 Voices

A weekly feature where the focus is ethnic
communities (RNZ)

7:05 The TED Radio Hour

A crafted hour of ideas worth sharing
presented by Guy Raz (NPR)

8:06 Sunday Night with Grant Walker

An evening of music and nostalgia (RNZ)

10:00 The 10 O'Clock Report

A roundup of today's news and sport

10:12 Mediawatch

Critical examination and analysis of recent
performance and trends in New Zealand's
news media (RNZ)

10:45 The House

Legislation, issues and insights from
Parliament (RNZ)

11:04 The Retro Cocktail Hour

An hour of music that's "shaken, not stirred"
every week from the Underground Martini
Bunker at Kansas Public Radio (KPR)

Monday  5 November 2018

12:04 All Night Programme

Including: 12:05 Music after Midnight; 12:30
Health Check (BBC); 1:05 Te Ahi Kaa (RNZ);
2:06 50 Things That Made the Modern
Economy (BBC); 2:30 New Horizons (RNZ);
3:05 Passport to Hell by Robin Hyde read by
Catherine Wilkin (6 of 15, RNZ); 3:30 Science In
Action (BBC); 4:25 Pacific Artist Award (RNZ);
4:35 Digital Marketing (RNZ); 4:55 Book
Review (RNZ); 5:10 Witness (BBC)

6:00 Morning Report

RNZ's three-hour breakfast news show with
news and interviews, bulletins on the hour
and half-hour, including:
6:20 and 6:50 Business News
6:26 Rural News
6:48 and 7:45 NZ Newspapers

9:06 Nine to Noon with Kathryn Ryan

Current affairs and topics of interest,
including:

10:45 The Reading: The New Ships by Kate
Duignan read by Nick Blake - Peter Collie is
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adrift in the wake of his wife's death. His
attempts to understand the turn his life has
taken lead him back to the past, to dismaying
events on an Amsterdam houseboat in the
seventies, returning to New Zealand and
meeting Moira, an amateur painter who
carried secrets of her own, and to a trip to
Europe years later with his family. An
unexpected revelation forces Peter to
navigate anew his roles as a husband, father
and son (10 of 12, RNZ)

12:00 Midday Report

RNZ news, followed by updates and reports
until 1.00pm, including:
12:16 Business News
12:26 Sport
12:34 Rural News
12:43 Worldwatch

1:06 Jesse Mulligan

An upbeat mix of the curious and the
compelling, ranging from the stories of the
day to the great questions of our time (RNZ)

4:06 The Panel with Jim Mora

An hour of discussion featuring a range of
panellists from right along the opinion
spectrum (RNZ)

5:00 Checkpoint

RNZ's weekday drive-time news and current
affairs programme

6:30 Trending Now

Bob Sutton:  How to Deal with Toxic People
Who Treat You Like Dirt

Zane Wedding – Competitive tree climbing

7:06 Nights with Bryan Crump

RNZ's weeknight programme of
entertainment and information

8:15 Dateline Pacific

A daily current affairs programme covering
the major Pacific stories of the week, with
background and reaction from the people
making the news (RNZ)

8:30 Windows on the World

International public radio features and
documentaries

9:30 Insight

An award-winning documentary programme
providing comprehensive coverage of
national and international current affairs
(RNZ)

10:00 News at Ten

A roundup of today's news and sport

10:15 Lately with Karyn Hay

A late night radio show with an eye on live
events, an ear for music, a great sense of
humour and a genuine interest in people and
their stories (RNZ)

11:06 Nashville Babylon

Wairarapa's Mark Rogers presents a selection
of old and new music - the very best in
alt.country, Americana and blues (Arrow FM)

Tuesday  6 November 2018

12:04 All Night Programme

Including: 12:05 Music after Midnight; 12:30
Black Sheep (RNZ); 1:05 Sir Thomas
Eichelbaum (RNZ); 1:40 Businesses Failure
 (RNZ); 2:05 Music Extra: Steve Gadd(RNZ); 
3:05 Passport to Hell by Robin Hyde read by
Catherine Wilkin (7 of 15, RNZ); 3:30 Author’s
View (RNZ); 4:25 The Mata Aho (RNZ);
4:35Galleries of Maoriland (RNZ); 4:55 Book
Review (RNZ);  5:10 Witness (BBC)

6:00 Morning Report

RNZ's three-hour breakfast news show with
news and interviews, bulletins on the hour
and half-hour, including:
6:20 and 6:50 Business News
6:26 Rural News
6:48 and 7:45 NZ Newspapers

9:06 Nine to Noon with Kathryn Ryan

Current affairs and topics of interest,
including:

10:45 The Reading: The New Ships by Kate
Duignan read by Nick Blake - Peter Collie is
adrift in the wake of his wife's death. His
attempts to understand the turn his life has
taken lead him back to the past, to dismaying
events on an Amsterdam houseboat in the
seventies, returning to New Zealand and
meeting Moira, an amateur painter who
carried secrets of her own, and to a trip to
Europe years later with his family. An
unexpected revelation forces Peter to
navigate anew his roles as a husband, father
and son (11 of 12, RNZ)

12:00 Midday Report

RNZ news, followed by updates and reports
until 1.00pm, including:
12:16 Business News
12:26 Sport
12:34 Rural News
12:43 Worldwatch

1:06 Jesse Mulligan

An upbeat mix of the curious and the

compelling, ranging from the stories of the
day to the great questions of our time (RNZ)

4:06 The Panel with Jim Mora

An hour of discussion featuring a range of
panellists from right along the opinion
spectrum (RNZ)

5:00 Checkpoint

RNZ's weekday drive-time news and current
affairs programme

6:30 Trending Now

Two Cents Worth   the news affecting your
back pocket - with Bernard Hickey, Nikki
Mandow, Jenee Tibshraeny and Gyles
Beckford

6:55 The House

Legislation, issues and insights from
Parliament (RNZ)

7:06 Nights with Bryan Crump

RNZ's weeknight programme of
entertainment and information

7:35 The Sampler

Nick Bollinger reviews some of the latest
music releases

8:15 Dateline Pacific

A daily current affairs programme covering
the major Pacific stories of the week, with
background and reaction from the people
making the news (RNZ)

8:30 Windows on the World

International public radio features and
documentaries

9:06 The Tuesday Feature

Everyday Americans The opioid epidemic has
become a major problem in America and
especially in Kentucky  - one of the first 
states to be hit hard by a problem which
started with over-prescribing of prescription
drugs.. Today's fiinal episode of our BBC
documentary series 'Everyday Americans'
explores the question What will the impact be
on the next generation. (BBC)

10:00 News at Ten

A roundup of today's news and sport

10:15 Lately with Karyn Hay

A late night radio show with an eye on live
events, an ear for music, a great sense of
humour and a genuine interest in people and
their stories (RNZ)

11:06 Worlds of Music

Trevor Reekie hosts a weekly music
programme celebrating an eclectic mix of

'world' music, fusion and folk roots (RNZ)

Wednesday  7 November 2018

12:04 All Night Programme

Including: 12:06 Music after Midnight; 12:30
Insight (RNZ); 1:05 Country Life Story (RNZ);
1:45 More or Less (BBC); 2:05 The Forum
(BBC); 3:05 Passport to Hell by Robin
Hyde read by Catherine Wilkin (8 of 15, RNZ);
3:30 Diversions (RNZ); 4:25 Ageing in NZ
(RNZ); 4:35 WWI's Health Impacts (RNZ); 4:55
Book Review (RNZ); 5:10 Witness (BBC)

6:00 Morning Report

RNZ's three-hour breakfast news show with
news and interviews, bulletins on the hour
and half-hour, including:
6:20 and 6:50 Business News
6:26 Rural News
6:48 and 7:45 NZ Newspapers

9:06 Nine to Noon with Kathryn Ryan

Current affairs and topics of interest,
including:

10:45 The Reading: The New Ships by Kate
Duignan read by Nick Blake - Peter Collie is
adrift in the wake of his wife's death. His
attempts to understand the turn his life has
taken lead him back to the past, to dismaying
events on an Amsterdam houseboat in the
seventies, returning to New Zealand and
meeting Moira, an amateur painter who
carried secrets of her own, and to a trip to
Europe years later with his family. An
unexpected revelation forces Peter to
navigate anew his roles as a husband, father
and son (12 of 12, RNZ)

12:00 Midday Report

RNZ news, followed by updates and reports
until 1.00pm, including:
12:16 Business News
12:26 Sport
12:34 Rural News
12:43 Worldwatch

1:06 Jesse Mulligan

An upbeat mix of the curious and the
compelling, ranging from the stories of the
day to the great questions of our time (RNZ)

4:06 The Panel with Jim Mora

An hour of discussion featuring a range of
panellists from right along the opinion
spectrum (RNZ)

5:00 Checkpoint

RNZ's drive-time news and current affairs
programme
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7:06 Nights with Bryan Crump

RNZ's weeknight programme of
entertainment and information

7:35 At the Movies

A weekly topical magazine about current film
releases and film related topics (RNZ)

8:15 Dateline Pacific

A daily current affairs programme covering
the major Pacific stories of the week, with
background and reaction from the people
making the news (RNZ)

8:30 Windows on the World

International public radio features and
documentaries

9:06 The Wednesday Drama

10:00 News at Ten

A roundup of today's news and sport

10:15 Lately with Karyn Hay

A late night radio show with an eye on live
events, an ear for music, a great sense of
humour and a genuine interest in people and
their stories (RNZ)

11:06 Inside Out with Nick Tipping

Nick Tipping brings you classic recordings
and modern masterpieces from the world of
jazz (RNZ)

Thursday  8 November 2018

12:04 All Night Programme

Including: 12:05 Music after Midnight; 12:30
Discovery (BBC); 1:05 The Thursday Feature:
Ratana  (RNZ); 2:05 NZ Books (RNZ); 2:40 The
Sampler (RNZ); 3:05 Passport to Hell by Robin
Hyde read by Catherine Wilkin (9 of 15, RNZ);
3:30 The Cultural Frontline (BBC);
4:25 Interpreting Heritage (RNZ); 4:35
Timekeeping (RNZ); 4:55 Book Review
(RNZ); 5:10 Witness (BBC)

6:00 Morning Report

RNZ's three-hour breakfast news show with
news and interviews, bulletins on the hour
and half-hour, including:
6:20 and 6:50 Business News
6:26 Rural News
6:48 and 7:45 NZ Newspapers

9:06 Nine to Noon with Kathryn Ryan

Current affairs and topics of interest,
including:
10:45 The Reading: Sprung by Terry Locke - A
retired householder attempts to exact
revenge on hapless graffiti artists (RNZ)

12:00 Midday Report

RNZ news, followed by updates and reports
until 1.00pm, including:
12:16 Business News
12:26 Sport
12:34 Rural News
12:43 Worldwatch

1:06 Jesse Mulligan

An upbeat mix of the curious and the
compelling, ranging from the stories of the
day to the great questions of our time (RNZ)

4:06 The Panel with Jim Mora

An hour of discussion featuring a range of
panellists from right along the opinion
spectrum (RNZ)

5:00 Checkpoint

RNZ's weekday drive-time news and current
affairs programme

6:30 Trending Now

Political commentators Brigitte Morten and
Mike Williams

6:55 The House

Legislation, issues and insights from
Parliament (RNZ)

7:06 Nights with Bryan Crump

RNZ's weeknight programme of
entertainment and information

7:30 New Horizons

With Music commentator and critic William
Dart (RNZ)

8:15 Dateline Pacific

A daily current affairs programme covering
the major Pacific stories of the week, with
background and reaction from the people
making the news (RNZ)

8:30 Windows on the World

International public radio features and
documentaries

9:06 Our Changing World

Highlights from the world of science and the
environment, with Alison Ballance (RNZ)

9:30 The Podcast

Richard Scott hunts out the best podcasts
from New Zealand and around the world to
help you discover what to listen to next (RNZ)

10:00 News at Ten

A roundup of today's news and sport

10:15 Lately with Karyn Hay

A late night radio show with an eye on live
events, an ear for music, a great sense of
humour and a genuine interest in people and
their stories (RNZ)

11:06 The Music 101 Pocket Edition

Music, interviews, live performances, behind
the scenes, industry issues, career profiles,
new, back catalogue, undiscovered, greatest
hits, tall tales - with a focus on New
Zealand/Aotearoa (RNZ)

Friday  9 November 2018

12:04 All Night Programme

Including: 12:05 Music after Midnight; 12:30
At The Movies (RNZ); 1:05 The Friday Feature
(RNZ); 2:05 Eyewitness (RNZ); 2:30  Friday Live
–David Dallas (RNZ); 3:05 Passport to Hell by
Robin Hyde read by Catherine Wilkin (10 of
15, RNZ); 3:30 The Why Factor (BBC);  4:25 Rug
Repairer (RNZ); 4:35 Tree Climbing (RNZ); 4:55
(Book Review RNZ); 5:10 Witness (BBC)

6:00 Morning Report

RNZ's three-hour breakfast news show with
news and interviews, bulletins on the hour
and half-hour, including:
6:20 and 6:50 Business News
6:26 Rural News
6:48 and 7:45 NZ Newspapers

9:06 Nine to Noon with Kathryn Ryan

Current affairs and topics of interest,
including:
10:45 The Reading: Blackberry Pie by
Adrienne Frater - A house-husband searches
for the ultimate recipe that will inflame his
wife's passions (RNZ)

12:00 Midday Report

RNZ news, followed by updates and reports
until 1.00pm, including:
12:16 Business News
12:26 Sport
12:34 Rural News
12:43 Worldwatch

1:06 Jesse Mulligan

An upbeat mix of the curious and the
compelling, ranging from the stories of the
day to the great questions of our time (RNZ)

4:06 The Panel with Jim Mora

An hour of discussion featuring a range of
panellists from right along the opinion
spectrum (RNZ)

5:00 Checkpoint

RNZ's weekday drive-time news and current
affairs programme

6:30 Trending Now

Mike Jackson: Trapping pests

6:43 Focus on Politics

Analysis of significant political issues
presented by Radio New Zealand's
parliamentary reporting team (RNZ)

7:06 Nights with Bryan Crump

RNZ's weeknight programme of
entertainment and information

8:15 Dateline Pacific

A daily current affairs programme covering
the major Pacific stories of the week, with
background and reaction from the people
making the news (RNZ)

8:30 Friday Night Live

(RNZ)

9:06 Country Life

Memorable scenes, people and places in
rural New Zealand (RNZ)

10:00 News at Ten

A roundup of today's news and sport

10:15 Lately with Karyn Hay

A late night radio show with an eye on live
events, an ear for music, a great sense of
humour and a genuine interest in people and
their stories (RNZ)

11:06 The Mixtape

Musical guests compile a C60 and talk us
through their selections (RNZ)

http://www.bbc.co.uk/programmes/p002w557/episodes/player
https://www.radionz.co.nz/search/results?utf8=%E2%9C%93&q=The+Ratana+Church+75th+Anniversary&commit=Search
https://www.radionz.co.nz/search/results?utf8=%E2%9C%93&q=The+Ratana+Church+75th+Anniversary&commit=Search
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/ninetonoon/audio/2018661183/ingrid-coles-from-a-japanese-concentration-camp-to-life-in-nz
http://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/thesampler
http://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/thesampler
https://www.radionz.co.nz/collections/readings/passport-to-hell-by-robin-hyde
https://www.radionz.co.nz/collections/readings/passport-to-hell-by-robin-hyde
http://www.bbc.co.uk/programmes/p0362l0f/episodes/player
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/standing-room-only/audio/2018669714/museum-consultant-sue-hodges-on-interpreting-our-heritage
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/ninetonoon/audio/2018669471/150th-anniversary-of-nz-standard-time
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/ninetonoon/audio/2018668280/book-review-the-year-of-the-farmer-by-rosalie-ham
http://www.bbc.co.uk/programmes/p004t1hd/episodes/player
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/ninetonoon/audio/2018669801/political-commentators-morten-and-williams
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/ninetonoon/audio/2018669801/political-commentators-morten-and-williams
http://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/atthemovies/library
https://www.bbc.co.uk/programmes/w3csxhlb
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/nat-music/audio/2591586/david-dallas-live-at-south-auckland-s-barry-curtis-park
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/nat-music/audio/2591586/david-dallas-live-at-south-auckland-s-barry-curtis-park
https://www.radionz.co.nz/collections/readings/passport-to-hell-by-robin-hyde
https://www.radionz.co.nz/collections/readings/passport-to-hell-by-robin-hyde
http://www.bbc.co.uk/programmes/p00xtky9/episodes/player
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/ninetonoon/audio/2018668955/the-kiwi-the-knight-and-the-qashqai
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/ninetonoon/audio/2018668955/the-kiwi-the-knight-and-the-qashqai
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/saturday/audio/2018669622/zane-wedding-champion-tree-climber
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/ninetonoon/audio/2018668460/unity-books-review-the-ice-shelf-by-anne-kennedy
http://www.bbc.co.uk/programmes/p004t1hd/episodes/player
https://www.radionz.co.nz/national/programmes/afternoons/audio/2018669829/expert-feature-trapping-pests

